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Wearable Art InLight Competition and Fashion Show

1708 Gallery calls all creative individuals to submit entries for the 
13th Annual Wearable Art InLight competition and fashion show.  
A creative fusion of fashion, sculpture, media and movement, 
Wearable Art InLight is a component of InLight Richmond, the third 
annual celebration of light-inspired contemporary art. The winning 
designs will be presented in a fashion show which will take place 
outside on Friday, October 22, 2010 in Richmond’s historic Shockoe 
Slip. There will be opportunity for window displays in local fashion 
boutiques for the winning designs.

Organized by 1708 Gallery, InLight Richmond is an exploration and 
celebration of contemporary art including an exhibition of light-
inspired art installations by international artists, the Wearable Art 
fashion show and a Community Lantern Parade. For more details 
about InLight Richmond and to see images from previous years, 
please visit our website: www.1708gallery.org/inlight. 

Inspiration:
InLight Richmond transforms a part of Richmond into an outside 
light-inspired art experience. The proposed concepts and designs 
for Wearable Art InLight should reflect the theme of light.  To draw 
inspiration for your design, we invite you to take a guided tour of the 
costume and textile collection at the Valentine Richmond History 
Center (richmondhistorycenter.com). If you’re interested in signing 
up for  a tour, please contact InLight Project Manager, Kerry Mills at 
kmills@1708gallery.org (space is limited).    

Details:  

  Deadline for submissions: 5 p.m. Friday, September 25, 2010

  Please submit your entry online at www.1708gallery.org/inlight

  A panel of judges will select the winning pieces of wearable art to 	
  be presented in the fashion show

  Artists will be notified by Wednesday, September 29, 2010

  If selected, each participant is wholly responsible for organizing 		
  their entry including supplying a model for the fashion show

  A panel of judges will distribute a variety of awards valued at 		
  more than $2,000
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IMAGE CREDITS: top to bottom: Wearable 
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